
creditors contingent creditors,  
and persons who may
otherwise be interested in the  
will or estate, or both, of:
CRAIG AARON LUOTO
A Petition for Probate
has been filed by:
KAREN ALEXANDER
in the Superior Court of
California, County of Butte.
The Petition for Probate
requests that: KAREN
ALEXANDER
be appointed as personal
representative to administer the
estate of the decedent.
The petition requests the
decedent’s will and codicils, if  
any, be admitted to probate.  
The will and any codicils are  
available for examination in the  
file kept by the court.
The petition requests authority  
to administer the estate under  
the Independent Administration  
of Estates Act. (This authority  
will allow the personal
representative to take many
actions without obtaining court  
approval. Before taking certain  
very important actions,
however, the personal
representative will be required  
to give notice to interested
persons unless they have  
waived notice or consented to  
the proposed action.) The
independent administration
authority will be granted unless  
an interested person files an  
objection to the petition and  
shows good cause why the  
court should not grant the
authority.
A hearing on the petition will be  
held in this court as follows:
Date: May 14, 2019
Time: 9:00 a.m.
Dept: Probate
Room: 
Address of the court:
Superior Court of California
County of Butte
1775 Concord Ave.

may be in person or by your
attorney.
IF YOU ARE A CREDITOR or  
contingent creditor of the
decedent, you must file your  
claim with the court and mail a  
copy to the personal
representative appointed by the  
court within the later of
either (1) four months from the  
date of first issuance of
letters to a general personal  
representative, as defined in  
section 58(b) of the California  
Probate Code, or (2) 60 days  
from the date of mailing or
personal delivery to you of a  
notice under section 9052 of  
the California Probate Code.
Other California statutes and
legal authority may affect your  
rights as a creditor. You may  
want to consult an attorney  
knowledgeable in California  
law.
YOU MAY EXAMINE the file  
kept by the court. If you are a  
person interested in the estate,  
you may file with the court a
Request for Special Notice  
(form DE-154) of the filing of an  
inventory and appraisal of
estate assets or of any petition  
or account as provided in
Probate Code section 1250.
A Request for Special Notice  
form is available from the court  
clerk.
Attorney for petitioner:
RAOUL J. LECLERC
P.O. Drawer 111
Oroville, CA 95965
(530) 533-5661
Dated: April 10, 2019
Case Number: 19PR00160
Published: April 18,25, May 2,  
2019

NOTICE OF PETITION
TO ADMINISTER
ESTATE
CRAIG AARON LUOTO
To all heirs, beneficiaries,

held in this court as follows:
Date: May 14, 2019
Time: 9:00 a.m.
Dept: PR
Room: 
Address of the court:
Superior Court of California
County of Butte
1775 Concord Ave.
Chico, CA 95926.
IF YOU OBJECT to the granting  
of the petition, you should
appear at the hearing and state  
your objections or file written  
objections with the court before  
the hearing. Your appearance  
may be in person or by your
attorney.
IF YOU ARE A CREDITOR or  
contingent creditor of the
decedent, you must file your  
claim with the court and mail a  
copy to the personal
 representative appointed by  
the court within the later of
either (1) four months from the  
date of first issuance of
letters to a general personal  
representative, as defined in  
section 58(b) of the California  
Probate Code, or (2) 60 days  
from the date of mailing or
personal delivery to you of a  
notice under section 9052 of  
the California Probate Code.
Other California statutes and
legal authority may affect your  
rights as a creditor. You may  
want to consult an attorney  
knowledgeable in California  
law.
YOU MAY EXAMINE the file  
kept by the court. If you are a  
person interested in the estate,  
you may file with the court a
Request for Special Notice  
(form DE-154) of the filing of an  
inventory and appraisal of
estate assets or of any petition  
or account as provided in
Probate Code section 1250.
A Request for Special Notice  
form is available from the court  
clerk.
Attorney for petitioner:
VANESSA J. SUNDIN
Sundin Law Office
341 Broadway Street, Ste. 302
Chico, CA 95928
(530) 342-2452
Case Number: 19PR00112
Published: April 18,25, May 2,  
2019

NOTICE OF PETITION
TO ADMINISTER
ESTATE
CLIFFORD ALLEN FRAZIER
To all heirs, beneficiaries,
creditors contingent creditors,  
and persons who may
otherwise be interested in the  
will or estate, or both, of:
CLIFFORD ALLEN FRAZIER
A Petition for Probate
has been filed by:
DANE FRAZIER
in the Superior Court of
California, County of Butte.
The Petition for Probate
requests that: DANE FRAZIER
be appointed as personal
representative to administer the
estate of the decedent.
The petition requests the
decedent’s will and codicils, if  
any, be admitted to probate.  
The will and any codicils are  
available for examination in the  
file kept by the court.
The petition requests authority  
to administer the estate under  
the Independent Administration  
of Estates Act. (This authority  
will allow the personal
representative to take many
actions without obtaining court  
approval. Before taking certain  
very important actions,
however, the personal
representative will be required  
to give notice to interested
persons unless they have  
waived notice or consented to  
the proposed action.) The
independent administration
authority will be granted unless  
an interested person files an  
objection to the petition and  
shows good cause why the  
court should not grant the
authority.
A hearing on the petition will be  
held in this court as follows:
Date: May 21, 2019
Time: 9:00 a.m.
Dept: Probate
Room: TBD
Address of the court:
Superior Court of California
County of Butte
1775 Concord Ave.
Chico, CA 95926.

The Petition for Probate
requests that: STEPHANIE M.  
ADAMS
be appointed as personal
representative to administer the
estate of the decedent.
The petition requests authority  
to administer the estate under  
the Independent Administration  
of Estates Act. (This authority  
will allow the personal
representative to take many
actions without obtaining court  
approval. Before taking certain  
very important actions,
however, the personal
representative will be required  
to give notice to interested
persons unless they have  
waived notice or consented to  
the proposed action.) The
independent administration
authority will be granted unless  
an interested person files an  
objection to the petition and  
shows good cause why the  
court should not grant the
authority.
A hearing on the petition will be  
held in this court as follows:
Date: May 7, 2019
Time: 9:00 a.m.
Dept: TBA
Room: 
Address of the court:
Superior Court of California
County of Butte
1775 Concord Ave.
Chico, CA 95926.
IF YOU OBJECT to the granting  
of the petition, you should
appear at the hearing and state  
your objections or file written  
objections with the court before  
the hearing. Your appearance  
may be in person or by your
attorney.
IF YOU ARE A CREDITOR or  
contingent creditor of the
decedent, you must file your  
claim with the court and mail a  
copy to the personal
representative appointed by the  
court within the later of
either (1) four months from the  
date of first issuance of
letters to a general personal  
representative, as defined in  
section 58(b) of the California  
Probate Code, or (2) 60 days  
from the date of mailing or
personal delivery to you of a  
notice under section 9052 of  
the California Probate Code.
Other California statutes and
legal authority may affect your  
rights as a creditor. You may  
want to consult an attorney  
knowledgeable in California  
law.
YOU MAY EXAMINE the file  
kept by the court. If you are a  
person interested in the estate,  
you may file with the court a
Request for Special Notice  
(form DE-154) of the filing of an  
inventory and appraisal of
estate assets or of any petition  
or account as provided in
Probate Code section 1250.
A Request for Special Notice  
form is available from the court  
clerk.
Attorney for Petitioner:
DANA L. CAMPBELL, ESQ.
Tyree & Campbell, LLP
1600 Humboldt Road, Suite 4
Chico, CA 95928
(530) 894-2100
Case Number: 19PR00140
Dated: March 25, 2019
Published: April 4,11,18, 2019

NOTICE OF PETITION
TO ADMINISTER
ESTATE
STEVEN J. MOONEY (also  
known as STEVEN JOHN  
MOONEY)
To all heirs, beneficiaries,
creditors contingent creditors,  
and persons who may
otherwise be interested in the  
will or estate, or both, of:
STEVEN J. MOONEY, STEVEN  
JOHN MOONEY, STEVEN  
MOONEY
A petition for Probate
has been filed by:
LISA M. MOONEY
in the Superior Court of
California, County of Butte.
The Petition for Probate
requests that: LISA M.
MOONEY
be appointed as personal
representative to administer the
estate of the decedent.
The petition requests authority  
to administer the estate under  
the Independent Administration  
of Estates Act. (This authority  

will allow the personal
representative to take many
actions without obtaining court  
approval. Before taking certain  
very important actions,
however, the personal
representative will be required  
to give notice to interested
persons unless they have  
waived notice or consented to  
the proposed action.) The
independent administration
authority will be granted unless  
an interested person files an  
objection to the petition and  
shows good cause why the  
court should not grant the
authority.
A hearing on the petition will be  
held in this court as follows:
Date: April 30, 2019
Time: 9:00 a.m.
Dept: Probate
Room: 
Address of the court:
Superior Court of California
County of Butte
1775 Concord Ave.
Chico, CA 95926.
IF YOU OBJECT to the granting  
of the petition, you should
appear at the hearing and state  
your objections or file written  
objections with the court before  
the hearing. Your appearance  
may be in person or by your
attorney.
IF YOU ARE A CREDITOR or  
contingent creditor of the
decedent, you must file your  
claim with the court and mail a  
copy to the personal
representative appointed by the  
court within the later of
either (1) four months from the  
date of first issuance of
letters to a general personal  
representative, as defined in  
section 58(b) of the California  
Probate Code, or (2) 60 days  
from the date of mailing or
personal delivery to you of a  
notice under section 9052 of  
the California Probate Code.
Other California statutes and
legal authority may affect your  
rights as a creditor. You may  
want to consult an attorney  
knowledgeable in California  
law.
YOU MAY EXAMINE the file  
kept by the court. If you are a  
person interested in the estate,  
you may file with the court a
Request for Special Notice  
(form DE-154) of the filing of an  
inventory and appraisal of
estate assets or of any petition  
or account as provided in
Probate Code section 1250.
A Request for Special Notice  
form is available from the court  
clerk.
Attorney for Petitioner:
NICOLE R. PLOTTEL
466 Vallombrosa Avenue
Chico, CA 95926
(530) 893-2882
Case Number: 19PR00152
Dated: April 2, 2019
Published: April 11,18,25, 2019

NOTICE OF PETITION
TO ADMINISTER
ESTATE
SHEILA H. SCOTT
To all heirs, beneficiaries,
creditors contingent creditors,  
and persons who may
otherwise be interested in the  
will or estate, or both, of:
SHEILA H. SCOTT
A petition for Probate
has been filed by:
LARRY B. SAISE
in the Superior Court of
California, County of Butte.
The Petition for Probate
requests that: LARRY B. SAISE
be appointed as personal
representative to administer the
estate of the decedent.
The petition requests authority  
to administer the estate under  
the Independent Administration  
of Estates Act. (This authority  
will allow the personal
representative to take many
actions without obtaining court  
approval. Before taking certain  
very important actions,
however, the personal
representative will be required  
to give notice to interested
persons unless they have  
waived notice or consented to  
the proposed action.) The
independent administration
authority will be granted unless  
an interested person files an  
objection to the petition and  
shows good cause why the  

court should not grant the
authority.
A hearing on the petition will be  
held in this court as follows:
Date: May 7, 2019
Time: 9:00 a.m.
Dept: 
Room: 
Address of the court:
Superior Court of California
County of Butte
1775 Concord Ave.
Chico, CA 95926.
IF YOU OBJECT to the granting  
of the petition, you should
appear at the hearing and state  
your objections or file written  
objections with the court before  
the hearing. Your appearance  
may be in person or by your
attorney.
IF YOU ARE A CREDITOR or  
contingent creditor of the
decedent, you must file your  
claim with the court and mail a  
copy to the personal
representative appointed by the  
court within the later of
either (1) four months from the  
date of first issuance of
letters to a general personal  
representative, as defined in  
section 58(b) of the California  
Probate Code, or (2) 60 days  
from the date of mailing or
personal delivery to you of a  
notice under section 9052 of  
the California Probate Code.
Other California statutes and
legal authority may affect your  
rights as a creditor. You may  
want to consult an attorney  
knowledgeable in California  
law.
YOU MAY EXAMINE the file  
kept by the court. If you are a  
person interested in the estate,  
you may file with the court a
Request for Special Notice  
(form DE-154) of the filing of an  
inventory and appraisal of
estate assets or of any petition  
or account as provided in
Probate Code section 1250.
A Request for Special Notice  
form is available from the court  
clerk.
Attorney for Petitioner:
SONYA K. FINN
The Law Offices of Leverenz &  
Finn
515 Wall Street
Chico, CA 95928
(530) 895-1621
Case Number: 19PR00158
Dated: April 8, 2019
Published: April 11,18,25, 2019

NOTICE OF PETITION
TO ADMINISTER
ESTATE
LAWRENCE JAMES
CAMPBELL, aka LAWRENCE J.  
CAMPBELL
To all heirs, beneficiaries,
creditors contingent creditors,  
and persons who may
otherwise be interested in the  
will or estate, or both, of:
LAWRENCE JAMES
CAMPBELL, also known as  
LAWRENCE J. CAMPBELL
A Petition for Probate
has been filed by:
KITTIYA K. CAMPBELL
in the Superior Court of
California, County of Butte.
The Petition for Probate
requests that: KITTIYA K.  
CAMPBELL
be appointed as personal
representative to administer the
estate of the decedent.
The petition requests the
decedent’s will and codicils, if  
any, be admitted to probate.  
The will and any codicils are  
available for examination in the  
file kept by the court.
The petition requests authority  
to administer the estate under  
the Independent Administration  
of Estates Act. (This authority  
will allow the personal
representative to take many
actions without obtaining court  
approval. Before taking certain  
very important actions,
however, the personal
representative will be required  
to give notice to interested
persons unless they have  
waived notice or consented to  
the proposed action.) The
independent administration
authority will be granted unless  
an interested person files an  
objection to the petition and  
shows good cause why the  
court should not grant the
authority.
A hearing on the petition will be  

IF YOU OBJECT to the granting  
of the petition, you should
appear at the hearing and state  
your objections or file written  
objections with the court before  
the hearing. Your appearance  
may be in person or by your
attorney.
IF YOU ARE A CREDITOR or  
contingent creditor of the
decedent, you must file your  
claim with the court and mail a  
copy to the personal
representative appointed by the  
court within the later of
either (1) four months from the  
date of first issuance of
letters to a general personal  
representative, as defined in  
section 58(b) of the California  
Probate Code, or (2) 60 days  
from the date of mailing or
personal delivery to you of a  
notice under section 9052 of  
the California Probate Code.
Other California statutes and
legal authority may affect your  
rights as a creditor. You may  
want to consult an attorney  
knowledgeable in California  
law.
YOU MAY EXAMINE the file  
kept by the court. If you are a  
person interested in the estate,  
you may file with the court a
Request for Special Notice  
(form DE-154) of the filing of an  
inventory and appraisal of
estate assets or of any petition  
or account as provided in
Probate Code section 1250.
A Request for Special Notice  
form is available from the court  
clerk.
Attorney for petitioner:
MARK JOHNSON
2531 Forest Avenue, Suite 100
Chico, CA 95928
(530) 345-6801
Case Number: 19PR00159
Dated: April 8, 2019
Published: April 18,25, May 2,  
2019

NOTICE OF PETITION
TO ADMINISTER
ESTATE
CHARLES ARTHUR HIGGS III  
aka CHARLES A. HIGGS III
To all heirs, beneficiaries,
creditors contingent creditors,  
and persons who may
otherwise be interested in the  
will or estate, or both, of:
CHARLES ARTHUR HIGGS III  
aka CHARLES A. HIGGS III
A Petition for Probate
has been filed by:
REBECCA A. KOSAK
in the Superior Court of
California, County of Butte.
The Petition for Probate
requests that: REBECCA A.
KOSAK
be appointed as personal
representative to administer the
estate of the decedent.
The petition requests the
decedent’s will and codicils, if  
any, be admitted to probate.  
The will and any codicils are  
available for examination in the  
file kept by the court.
The petition requests authority  
to administer the estate under  
the Independent Administration  
of Estates Act. (This authority  
will allow the personal
representative to take many
actions without obtaining court  
approval. Before taking certain  
very important actions,
however, the personal
representative will be required  
to give notice to interested
persons unless they have  
waived notice or consented to  
the proposed action.) The
independent administration
authority will be granted unless  
an interested person files an  
objection to the petition and  
shows good cause why the  
court should not grant the
authority.
A hearing on the petition will be  
held in this court as follows:
Date: May 14, 2019
Time: 9:00 a.m.
Dept: 10
Room: 
Address of the court:
Superior Court of California
County of Butte
1775 Concord Ave.
Chico, CA 95926.
IF YOU OBJECT to the granting  
of the petition, you should
appear at the hearing and state  
your objections or file written  
objections with the court before  
the hearing. Your appearance  
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Chico, CA 95926.
IF YOU OBJECT to the granting  
of the petition, you should
appear at the hearing and state  
your objections or file written  
objections with the court before  
the hearing. Your appearance  
may be in person or by your
attorney.
IF YOU ARE A CREDITOR or  
contingent creditor of the
decedent, you must file your  
claim with the court and mail a  
copy to the personal
representative appointed by the  
court within the later of
either (1) four months from the  
date of first issuance of
letters to a general personal  
representative, as defined in  
section 58(b) of the California  
Probate Code, or (2) 60 days  
from the date of mailing or
personal delivery to you of a  
notice under section 9052 of  
the California Probate Code.
Other California statutes and
legal authority may affect your  
rights as a creditor. You may  
want to consult an attorney  
knowledgeable in California  
law.
YOU MAY EXAMINE the file  
kept by the court. If you are a  
person interested in the estate,  
you may file with the court a
Request for Special Notice  
(form DE-154) of the filing of an  
inventory and appraisal of
estate assets or of any petition  
or account as provided in
Probate Code section 1250.
A Request for Special Notice  
form is available from the court  
clerk.
Attorney for petitioner:
RICHARD S. MATSON
Richard S. Matson Law Office,  
Inc. 
1342 The Esplanade, Suite A
Chico, CA 95926
(530) 343-5373
Dated: April 10, 2019
Case Number: 19PR00165
Published: April 18,25, May 2,  
2019
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